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PURCHASING PROCEDURES 
 
 
Purchasing for the Seven Oaks School Division shall be carried out under the 
authority and responsibility of the Secretary-Treasurer as directed by the 
Superintendent and shall be subject to the requirements of Section 70 of the 
Public Schools’ Act, School Board Policies and Purchasing Procedures.  
 
The Seven Oaks School Division is committed to the implementation of 
Sustainable Development and any associated enacted Provincial Regulation or 
guideline for School Divisions. 
 
The school board in the discharge of its duties shall at all times use the following 
procedures: 
 
a) All purchases shall be made in the most economical manner possible. 
 
b) Where the cost of goods or services exceeds $10,000.00, competitive offers 

shall be obtained, except in emergency situations. Public tender will be used 
as per Regulation 120/2010, Tender Limits, The Public Schools Act. 

 
c) All offers received pursuant to clause (b) shall be tabulated for ready 

reference for presentation to the school board.    
 
d) All tenders awarded on the basis of low bid shall be reported to the Board of 

Trustees as information.   
 
e) Tenders for items to be awarded on the basis of the lowest acceptable bid 

shall be presented to the Board of Trustees for approval. 
 
f) Lowest tender may not necessarily be accepted. 
 
g) Schools shall initiate purchases by forwarding a purchase order requisition to 

the Secretary-Treasurer's department for validation and approval. 
 
h) Principals may request the division to reimburse their school for small 

purchases paid out of individual school activity fund accounts. 
 
i) Participation in the Metro School Division Purchasing Committee. The Metro 

School Division Purchasing Committee undertakes joint tenders on behalf of 
school divisions. It is recognized that the division will participate in certain 
tenders and will assign the authority to award tenders to the Purchasing 
Committee. Each year the Board will receive a schedule for joint tenders to be 
undertaken by the Purchasing Committee. This schedule will indicate the 
tenders in which the division will participate. Administration will maintain a file 
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for such tenders. This file will be available for review by the Board or a Board 
member upon its request. 

 
j) Confirmation Orders: Verbal orders subject to subsequent confirmation by a 

written purchase order may be issued only in cases where a bona fide 
emergency situation exists which can be handled only by this procedure. 

 
k) Emergency Purchase and Expenditure: In the event of an emergency, the 

Chair or Vice-Chair of the Board together with the Superintendent, the 
Secretary-Treasurer and the administrator under whose department the 
expenditure is to be made, or any three of them, may authorize an emergency 
expenditure of up to $50,000 (exclusive of taxes) and such expenditure shall 
be reported to the Board at the next regular meeting. 

 
l) All purchases must be made in a way that conforms to the law, Public School 

Act and Regulations, policies of the Division and fulfills contractual 
obligations. Failure to do so may result in disciplinary action. 

 


